
 

 

 

For immediate release 

 

#ToughTimesTogether Wave 4 
HKBN to pass on 100% of Hong Kong & Macau COVID-19  

Government Subsidies to Talents 
Additional HK$15 million Subsidies to Pass on to All Talents in Singapore, Malaysia 

and Mainland China 
 

(Hong Kong – 27 April 2020) Further to three previous waves of the #ToughTimesTogether campaign 
which provided relief to a range of stakeholders, including one-month service fee waivers to one 
million residential and corporate customers, free broadband lines to underprivileged families and 
working opportunities to university graduates en masse, HKBN Group (“HKBN” or the “Group”,  SEHK 
stock code: 1310) announced today that it will initiate #ToughTimesTogether Wave 4 by passing on 
government subsidies to a total of more than 6,000 full-time Talents in Hong Kong and all 
regions/countries where it operates. 
 
Faced with unprecedented global economic challenges posed by COVID-19, many of HKBN's Talents 
have seen their overall family incomes adversely affected. Embracing the recent wage subsidy 
schemes announced by the Hong Kong SAR and Macau SAR Governments, HKBN has pledged to 
pass on all Talent-related payout funds that it will receive from both governments to about 3,500 
Talents in Hong Kong and Macau, without reducing their current salaries paid by the Group, and 
without any reduction to headcount as stipulated by the subsidy terms.  
 
“At HKBN, our Talents provide essential services to our communities, so we must first take great care 
of our Talents before they can take great care of our communities. At HKBN, ‘leaders eat last’*, so we 
must ensure there is enough to feed all Talents before top management get to eat,” said NiQ Lai, 
HKBN Co-Owner and Group CEO. 
 
According to the Hong Kong SAR Government, wage subsidies under the Employment Support 
Scheme are calculated based on 50% of wages in a specified month subject to a wage cap of 
HK$18,000 per month for six months. According to the Macau SAR Government, a one-time subsidy 
between MOP$15,000-$200,000 will be given to eligible employers according to the number of people 
they employ.  
 
Embracing its Core Purpose to “Make our Home a Better Place to Live” wherever the Group 
operates, HKBN will deploy HK$15 million in business subsidies received in Singapore, Malaysia and 
mainland China, as a one-time financial subsidy to over 2,500 Talents there. These Talents will each 
receive payment from HKBN at a range equivalent to around HK$3,000 – HK$25,000 in their 
upcoming payroll.  
 
NiQ added, “Together, all nine executives in our Management Committee will be donating all of our 
personal wage subsidies to charity, and we encourage fellow HKBNers who are under less financial 
difficulty to join us.” 
 
* Note: As inspired by Simon Sinek’s book “Leaders Eat Last” and his video 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ReRcHdeUG9Y.    
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